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HOME BANK: INDIANAPOLIS,  IN

Home Bank is located in Indianapolis, 
Indiana, was chartered in 1890 as a mutal 
institution which essentially means that 
it is owned by its depositors. Home Bank 
created a gifting program where 10% of 
the bank’s profits were to be allocated to 
support worthwhile projects addressing 
the greatest needs in the communities 
served.

BUILDING CHALLENGE:
After a difficult company had left this 
project behind, VT was there to help 
give the architect the guidance on what 
could be done with wood veneers, the 
selection of species of wood and most 
importantly, sketchface doors.
Due to VT having such a wide selection 
of sketchface veneer designs, the 

architect was able to have a creative and 
open mind during the selection process. 
The architect had a design in mind, the 
VT sales rep was able to provide a sample 
and the VT’s sketchface doors were a 
perfect fit to all of their needs.

VT’S CONTRIBUTION:
VT provided a total of 23 flush doors 
including sketchface and metallic inlay 
doors. The sketchface doors were 
multi-veneered featuring Quartered 
Mahogany, Quarted Walnut, and Rift 
Red Oak (random match) with a clear 
finish. The flush doors featured a 
Quartered Walnut (random match) with 
Wilsonart #6277 metallic inlays with a 

clear finish. 
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